
Tuesday 
December 2, 2014 
Gautier, Mississippi 

 
BE  IT  REMEMBERED  THAT  A  REGULAR  MEETING  of  the  Mayor  and 

Members of the Council of the City of Gautier, Mississippi was held December 2, 
2014 at 6:30 PM in the City Hall Municipal Building, 3330 Highway 90, 
Gautier, Mississippi. 

 
Those present were Mayor Gordon Gollott, Council Members, Mary 

Martin, Johnny Jones, Casey Vaughan, Samantha Abell, City Manager; 
Cynthia Russell, City Clerk; Joshua Danos, City Attorney and other concerned 
citizens. Those absent were Council Members Hurley Ray Guillotte and Adam 
Colledge.  Councilman Rusty Anderson via phone. 

 
_______________________________________________________________________ 

 
AGENDA 

CITY OF GAUTIER, MISSISSIPPI 
CITY HALL COUNCIL CHAMBERS 

December 2, 2014 @ 6:30 PM 
 

I. Call to Order         
 

1. Prayer 
 

2.  Pledge of Allegiance 
 
II. Agenda Order Approval  
 
III. Announcements 
 

 1.          Office closed Wednesday, December 24th and Thursday, December 25th in                    
             observance of Christmas Day. 
 
 2.         Office closed Thursday, January 1st and Friday, January 2nd in observance 
               of New Year’s Day. 
 

  3.         Christmas Carols performed by the Gator Chorale at City Hall Council                 
    Chambers Thursday, December 11th 9:00 A.M. 
   

IV.    Presentation Agenda  
 
V. Public Agenda 
       

1. Agenda Comments 
    

 
 

Page 1 of 88



VI.    Business Agenda  
  
 1. Consideration of a Conditional Use-Major Permit for the Living Word 
  Training & Resource Center at 2317 Highway 90 (GPC # 14-20-CU). 
  Kenneth Bridgette and Bernadette Guillette, owners.  
  (Quasi-Judicial Procedures) 
 
 2. Order authorizing advertisement for Billing and Work Order   
  Software. 
  
  3. Order authorizing the closing of City Administration offices on December  
   26th, in further observance of Christmas. 
 
 4. Order authorizing additional repair costs for damage to Public Works Back  
  Building caused by Hurricane Katrina (PW# 4214). 
 
 5. Order authorizing the grant agreement with Mississippi Department  
  of Marine Resources (MDMR) for FY 2015 Tidelands funding for the  
  City Park Community Center Phase III Project (FY2015-P501-18GA) 
 
 6. Order authorizing the grant agreement with the Mississippi Department of  
  Marine Resources (MDMR) for FY 2015 Tidelands funding or the Shepard  
  State Park Improvements Project (FY2015-P501-16A). 
             7. Order authorizing the submission of an application to the U.S. Department  
   of Homeland Security – Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA)  
   for FY 2014 Assistance to Firefighters Grant (AFG) funding. 
    
 8. Order approving Docket of Claims. 
 
VII.  Consent Agenda (All items approved in one motion) 
 
 1. Order approving the reappointment of Susan Parol to the Civil Service  
  Commission for a period of six (6) years, effective November 2014 thru  
  November 2020. 
 
 2. Order approving in-kind support services request for 2014 Gautier Rotary  
  Club Christmas Parade.  
 
 3. Order approving the minutes from Recessed Council Meeting held   
  November 18, 2014. 

   
  4. Order accepting October 2014 Privilege License Report. 
 
  5. Order approving water and sewer adjustments. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 2 of 88



  
                STUDY AGENDA 

               CITY OF GAUTIER, MISSISSIPPI 
            December 2, 2014 

 
1. Discuss Citizen Comments 

 
 2. Discuss Council Comments   

 
3. Discuss City Manager Comments 

 
4. Discuss City Clerk Comments 
 
5. Discuss City Attorney Comments 

 
       Recess until December 16, 2014 at 6:30 PM 

      www.gautier-ms.gov  
 

 
Councilwoman Martin made a motion to table Business item #5 & #6 for a work session and 
add Business item #9 to adjust Comptrollers salary from Grade 21 Step 0 to Grade 21 Step 2.  
Councilman Jones seconded the motion and the vote carried unanimously.  Absent were 
Councilman Guillotte and Councilman Colledge.   
 
        

ANNOUNCEMENTS 
 

1. Office closed Wednesday, December 24th and Thursday, 
December 25th in observance of Christmas Day. 

 
2. Office closed Thursday, January 1st and Friday, 

January 2nd in observance of New Year’s Day. 
 

3. Christmas Carols performed by the Gator Chorale at City 
Hall Council Chambers Thursday, December 11th 9:00 
A.M. 

 
4. City Manager added that Fire Station West was open 24/7 

as of 12/2/2014. 
 

        
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 3 of 88

http://www.gautier-ms.gov/


Page 4 of 88



There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
 

ORDER NUMBER 268-2014 
 

CITY OF GAUTIER 
CONDITIONAL USE-MAJOR DEVELOPMENT PERMIT 

GPC CASE NO. 14-20-CU 
 

LIVING WORD TRAINING AND RESOURCE CENTER 
 

REGARDING PARCEL ID NO: 82436050.050 
       
The City of Gautier City Council, at its regular meeting held on December 2, 2014, 
considered the application for a Conditional Use-Major Development Permit for church 
or place of worship as submitted by Kenneth Bridgette and Bernadette Guillette for the 
Living Word Training and Resource Center. The parcel subject to this Permit is located 
at 2317 Hwy 90, Gautier, Mississippi, 39553. After due public notice, the City Council, 
having considered the favorable recommendation by the Planning Commission, 
application, testimony and exhibits presented by the applicant, the report of the City 
Staff and all other relevant testimony, exhibits and other evidence, pursuant to 
applicable provisions of the City’s Unified Development Ordinance, hereby approves the 
Conditional Use-Major Development Permit as follows: 
 
1. This proposed Conditional Use-Major is consistent with the goals, objectives and 

policies of the City’s Comprehensive Plan.  
 
2. This proposed Conditional Use-Major is consistent with the character of the 

immediate vicinity of the proposed use.  
 
3. The proposed use, classified as a church or place of worship, is permitted as a 

Conditional Use-Major in the TCMU District.  
 
4. Therefore, the City Council accepts the recommendation of the Planning 

Commission and approves the application submitted on September 5, 2014 for a 
Conditional Use-Major Development Permit.  

 
5. The following additional conditions will ensure that the operation of the proposed 

conditional use will minimize any detrimental effects on neighboring properties 
and shall apply to the project: 

 
a. Within 6 months of issuance of the Major Conditional-Use Permit, the owner 

shall change the existing sign to reflect the new uses of the building as 
approved by the Technical Review Committee. 

 
b. The location shall meet all accessibility requirements for change of occupancy 

as stated in Section 3409 of the International Building Code. (See Exhibit E.) 

Page 5 of 88



 
d. The location shall meet all parking requirements as set forth in Article VII of the 

Unified Development Ordinance. 
 
6. The City Clerk shall have this permit recorded in the public records of Jackson 

County, at the expense of the applicant, and provide the applicant a copy of the 
permit with the recording information affixed.  

 
7. The Gautier Planning Commission recommended approval of this Conditional 

Use-Major Development Permit on November 6, 2014. 
 
8.      The City Council adopted this Conditional Use-Major Development Permit on a 

recorded vote of _5___ ayes to __0__ nays to approve the application of Living 
Word Training and Resource Center, located at 2317 Hwy 90, in Gautier, 
Mississippi, and identified as Jackson County Parcel No. 82436050.050.  

 
 Motion made by Councilman Vaughan, seconded by Councilwoman Martin and 
the following vote was recorded: 
 
  AYES: Gordon Gollott 
    Mary Martin 
    Johnny Jones 
    Casey Vaughan 
    Rusty Anderson 
      
  NAYS: None 
 
  ABSENT: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
    Adam Colledge 
 
 
 
December 2, 2014    _________________________________ 
Date of Issuance    Gordon Gollott, Mayor 
      City of Gautier, Mississippi 
Attest:     3330 Highway 90 
      Gautier, MS  39553 
 
_______________________________  
Cynthia Russell 
City Clerk          
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 6 of 88



QUASI-JUDICIAL PROCEDURES 

1. Announcement of Matter. Read the matter title to be considered. 

2. Swear the Witnesses. All witnesses, parties, citizen participants and City Staff 
who plan to speak at the hearing shall collectively be sworn at the beginning of the 
hearing by the City Attorney  

3. Ex Parte Disclosure. All members must disclose on the record any ex parte 
communications, to include any physical inspections of the subject property. The 
disclosure should include with whom any communication has taken place, a summary of 
the substance of the communication, and the date of the site visit, if any. If anyone has 
received written communications, the writing must be presented, read into record or a 
copy provided to all participants, and made a part of the official record.  
 
4. Applicant Presentation.  
 
5. Questions directed to Applicant. The applicant should answer any questions by 
the public, the Planning Commission, or others.  
 
6. Staff Presentation. This includes presentation of the staff report into the official 
record. 
 
7. Objections from Applicant. Confirm whether there are objections from the 
applicant regarding the staff report or development order.  
 
8. Questions directed to Staff. The staff answers any questions by the public, the 
Planning Commission, or others. 
 
9. Public Comments. Members of the public should be allowed to make comments 
regarding the application. 
 
10. Applicant rebuttal/final comments 
 
11. Staff rebuttal/final comments 
 
12. Call for final questions. 
 
13. Close public portion of the hearing. 
 
14. Motion & Deliberation. Planning Commission makes a motion, and debates and 
deliberates regarding the application and development order. 
 
15. Vote.  
 
16. Close the quasi-judicial proceeding. 

Page 7 of 88



CITY OF GAUTIER 
MEMORANDUM 

 
To:  Samantha Abell, City Manager  
 
From:  Chandra Nicholson, Economic Development & Planning Director 
 
Date:  November 20, 2014  
 
Subject: Conditional Use-Major Permit for the Living Word Training & Resource Center 

at 2317 Highway 90 (GPC Case No. 14-20-CU) 
 
           
 
REQUEST: 
 
Gautier Planning Commission recommends the City Council approve a Conditional Use-Major 
Permit to allow a Church at 2317 Highway 90 in a Town Center Mixed Use Zoning District, PID 
#82436050.050.  
 
The City Attorney has reviewed for legal sufficiency. 
 
DISCUSSION: 
 
Staff has attached a Staff Report with detailed project analysis.  The Planning Commission held a 
public hearing on November 6, 2014 to consider the request and found that the proposed Church 
will be compatible and harmonious with the TCMU district with certain conditions.  The GPC 
recommends the approval of the Conditional Use-Major Permit with the following Conditions:  
 

1. Within 6 months of issuance of the Major Conditional-Use Permit, the owner shall 
change the existing sign to reflect the new uses of the building as approved by the 
Technical Review Committee. 

 
2. The location shall meet all accessibility requirements for change of occupancy as 

stated in Section 3409 of the International Building Code. (See Exhibit E.) 
 

3. Noise levels shall meet the City’s noise ordinance. (See Exhibit F.) 
 
4. The location shall meet all parking requirements as set forth in Article VII of the 

Unified Development Ordinance. 
 
 

RECOMMENDATION: 
 
The Gautier Planning Commission and Staff recommend approval of the proposed Church 
Conditional Use-Major Permit with the conditions listed above. 

Page 8 of 88



 
The City Council may: 
 

1. Approve the Conditional Use-Major Permit with the Conditions listed above; or 
 

2. Approve the Conditional Use-Major Permit with changes; or 
 

3. Deny the Conditional Use-Major Permit. 
 
 
ATTACHMENTS:  
 

1. Draft Conditional Use-Major Permit 
  

2. GPC Meeting Minutes Excerpt 
 

3. GPC Staff Report with Back Up 

Page 9 of 88



Excerpt from Gautier Planning Commission Meeting held November 6, 2014. 
 
REQUEST: 
QUASI-JUDICIAL – REQUEST FOR A CONDITIONAL USE-MAJOR PERMIT TO ALLOW 
CHURCH SERVICES TO BE HELD IN A TOWN CENTER MIXED USE ZONING DISTRICT, 
2317 HWY 90 (KENNETH BRIDGETTE AND BRENADETTE GUILLETTE, OWNER)  
(GPC#14-20-CU) 
 
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
Commissioner Dailey made the motion to recommend approval of GPC#14-20-CU for a 
Conditional Use of a church in a Town Center with the following conditions: 
 
1. Within six (6) months of issuance of the Major Conditional-Use Permit, the owner 
 shall change the existing sign to reflect the new uses of the building as approved by the 
 Technical Review Committee. 
 
2. The location shall meet all accessibility requirements for change of occupancy as stated 
 in Section 3409 of the International Building Code. 
 
3. Noise levels shall meet the City’s noise ordinance. 
 
4. The location shall meet all parking requirements as set forth in Article VII of the Unified 
 Development Ordinance. 
 
5. Conforms to the International Building Code requirements for this occupancy particularly 
 exiting and separation requirements. 
 
Commissioner Wooten seconded the motion and the following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES:  David Wooten 
   Larry Dailey 
   Jimmy Green 
   Anthony York 
   Sandra Walters 
 
 NAYS:  None 
 
 ABSTAINED: Greg Spanier 
 
Motion passed. 

Page 10 of 88



 

Gautier Planning Commission 

Regular Meeting Agenda 

November 6, 2014 

GPC #14-20-CU 

2317 Hwy 90: Conditional Use-Major 

Living Word Training and Resource Center 

 

VII. NEW BUSINESS  
 

A. QUASI-JUDICIAL 
 

3. REQUEST FOR A CONDITIONAL USE-MAJOR PERMIT TO ALLOW 
CHURCH SERVICES TO BE HELD IN A TOWN CENTER MIXED USE 
ZONING DISTRICT, 2317 HWY 90 (KENNETH BRIDGETTE AND 
BERNADETTE GUILLETTE, OWNER) (GPC CASE #14-20-CU)  

 
 

 

Page 11 of 88



QUASI-JUDICIAL PROCEDURES 

1. Announcement of Matter. Read the matter title to be considered. 

2. Swear the Witnesses. All witnesses, parties, citizen participants and City Staff 
who plan to speak at the hearing shall collectively be sworn at the beginning of the 
hearing by the City Attorney  

3. Ex Parte Disclosure. All members must disclose on the record any ex parte 
communications, to include any physical inspections of the subject property. The 
disclosure should include with whom any communication has taken place, a summary of 
the substance of the communication, and the date of the site visit, if any. If anyone has 
received written communications, the writing must be presented, read into record or a 
copy provided to all participants, and made a part of the official record.  
 
4. Applicant Presentation.  
 
5. Questions directed to Applicant. The applicant should answer any questions by 
the public, the Planning Commission, or others.  
 
6. Staff Presentation. This includes presentation of the staff report into the official 
record. 
 
7. Objections from Applicant. Confirm whether there are objections from the 
applicant regarding the staff report or development order.  
 
8. Questions directed to Staff. The staff answers any questions by the public, the 
Planning Commission, or others. 
 
9. Public Comments. Members of the public should be allowed to make comments 
regarding the application. 
 
10. Applicant rebuttal/final comments 
 
11. Staff rebuttal/final comments 
 
12. Call for final questions. 
 
13. Close public portion of the hearing. 
 
14. Motion & Deliberation. Planning Commission makes a motion, and debates and 
deliberates regarding the application and development order. 
 
15. Vote.  
 
16. Close the quasi-judicial proceeding. 

Page 12 of 88



 CITY OF GAUTIER 
STAFF REPORT 

Kenneth Bridgette and Bernadette Guillette 
 (Living Word Training and Resource Center) 

 
To:  Chairman and Members, Planning Commission 
 
From:  Erica Greene, City Planner 
 
Date:  October 31, 2014                         
 
Subject: Conditional Use-Major Permit for Church Services in Town Center Mixed Used 

Zoning District to be held at 2317 Hwy 90 (GPC #14-20-CU) 
           
 
REQUEST: 
 
The Economic Development and Planning Department has received a request from Kenneth 
Bridgette and Bernadette Guillette, owner of the Living Word Training and Resource Center for 
a Conditional Use-Major Permit that would allow church services in a Town Center Mixed Use 
Zoning District at 2317 Hwy 90, PID #82436050.050.  The application fee of $250 was paid on 
September 5, 2014 and verified complete September 17, 2014.  

 
BACKGROUND:  
 
The request property is zoned Town Center Mixed Use.   
 

1. Location: 2317 Hwy 90 (See Exhibit  A) 
Principal Arterial: Hwy 90 

 
2. General features of the proposed project: 

Total Building Area: 8,610 square feet 
Site Size: 13.85 Acres 
Year Building Constructed: 1973 

 
3. Potable Water and Wastewater Services: Existing from City 

 
4. The building is set-up to be used as a retail shop.   

 
5. Current Zoning: Town Center Mixed Use  

 
6. Current Surrounding Zoning (See Exhibit B): Town Center Mixed Use 

 
7. Current Surrounding Existing Land Use (See Exhibit C): Town Center to the 

North; and Low Density Single Family to the West, East and South. 
  

Page 13 of 88



 

8. Comprehensive Plan Future Land Use Designation (See Exhibit D): Town Center 
Mixed Use 

 

DISCUSSION: 
 
The following addresses the review criteria for a Major Conditional Use outlined in Section 
4.17.5 of the UDO:   

 
1. Is the proposed use listed in the list of possible Conditional Uses in the particular Zoning 

District? 
 
Applicant: Yes, It is located in a commercial store front. The location is a brick and 
mortar building. 
 
Staff Finding: Yes. A church or place of worship is listed as a Conditional Use-Major in 
a TCMU zoning district.  
 

2. Describe how the project is compatible with the character of development in the vicinity 
relative to (a) density, bulk and intensity of structures, (b) parking, and (c) other uses.  
Please attach parking plan, site plan, architectural rendering or other plans. 
 
Applicant Response: The parking shared between the 3 adjacent businesses is shared. 
There are over 370 shared parking lot spaces.  

Staff Finding: The proposed use will be located in an existing building and will not 
further impact the density, bulk and intensity of the structures in the vicinity.  
    

3. Will your project negatively affect neighboring property values or pose a real or 
perceived threat to citizens?  Explain. 
 
Applicant Response: No, there is a neighboring church that conducts their services on 
Saturday and their revivals on Friday.  We conduct our services on Sunday morning and 
the parking is not an issue. 
  
Staff Finding: There is no evidence to indicate the proposed use will negatively affect the 
property values, or cause a detriment to the surrounding properties. 
 

4. Will your project adversely affect vehicular or pedestrian traffic in the vicinity?  Explain. 
 
Applicant Response: No.  There are no purposed problems with pedestrians. 
  

Page 14 of 88



 

Staff Finding:  There is no evidence that the proposed church/place of worship will have 
any adverse affect on vehicular or pedestrian traffic. 
 

5. Can the proposed use be accommodated by existing or proposed public services and 
facilities including, but not limited to, water, sanitary sewer, streets, drainage, police and 
fire protection, and schools?   
 
Applicant Response: Yes. Our water was provided by the City of Gautier. 

 
Staff Finding: The proposed use can be accommodated by existing public services and 
facilities.  
  

6. Is the proposed use in harmony with the Comprehensive Plan?  Explain how. 
 
Applicant: Yes. The plan is to have a training and resource center to educate the 
community, thus improving the moral. 
 
Staff Response: The Comprehensive Plan list a land use category for the parcel in Town 
Center. The Plan for future uses includes a list having mixed use buildings and 
community centers.  A church/place of worship would be considered appropriate in this 
zoning district. 
 

7. Does the proposed use pose a hazardous, detrimental, or disturbing affect, either real or 
perceived, to present surrounding land uses due to noises, glare, smoke, dust, odor, 
fumes, water pollution, vibration, electrical interference, or other nuisances?  Explain.  
 
Applicant Response: No hazardous products are being used in this business. 
  
Staff Finding: There is no evidence that the proposed use poses a hazardous, detrimental 
or disturbing affect to present surrounding uses. 
  

8. Does the use conform to all district regulations for the applicable district in which it is 
located, or have other provisions been provided for?  Explain. 
 
Applicant Response: Yes Attached is a list of all applicable plans for the business and 
ministry.  
 
Staff Finding: The proposed use can be made to conform to district regulations with 
certain conditions. 
 

Page 15 of 88



 

DETERMINATION OF APPLICABLE LAW: 
 

1. The UDO defines conditional uses as specific uses which are enumerated in each 
zoning district and which because of their nature are not allowed by right but may be 
allowed after the required review process.  The City may specify certain conditions as 
necessary to make the use compatible with other uses in the same district.  
Conditional uses are issued for uses of land and uses designated “Conditional Uses-
Major” is transferable from one (1) owner of land to another. 
 
The UDO further defines Conditional Uses-Major as uses that are not allowed by 
right but require a recommendation by the Planning Commission and the approval of 
the City Council. Additionally, if the conditional use is transferred to a new owner, 
the new owner must submit a letter to the Economic Development Director agreeing 
to the current terms and conditions before a business license may be issued. 

2. Conditional Uses-Major requires a public hearing before the Planning Commission 
and approval by the City Council (Section 4.14 of the UDO). 

 
RECOMMENDATION: 
  
Staff finds that the proposed use may be compatible and harmonious with the Town Center 
Mixed Use Zoning District and recommends approval with the following conditions: 
 

1. Within 6 months of issuance of the Major Conditional-Use Permit, the owner shall 
change the existing sign to reflect the new uses of the building as approved by the 
Technical Review Committee. 

 
2. The location shall meet all accessibility requirements for change of occupancy as 

stated in Section 3409 of the International Building Code. (See Exhibit E.) 
 

3. Noise levels shall meet the City’s noise ordinance. (See Exhibit F.) 
 
4. The location shall meet all parking requirements as set forth in Article VII of the 

Unified Development Ordinance. 
 

 
CONCLUSION: 
  
The Planning Commission may:  

 
1. Recommend that City Council approve the Conditional Use-Major with the Conditions 

listed; 

2. Recommend that City Council approve the Conditional Use-Major with changes; or 

3. Recommend that City Council deny the Conditional Use-Major. 

 

Page 16 of 88



 

   
ATTACHMENTS:  
 

1. Conditional Use Permit 

2. Applicant’s Exhibit 1 – Application 

3. City’s Exhibit A – Location Map 

4. City’s Exhibit B – Existing Zoning Map  

5. City’s Exhibit C – Existing Land Use Map 

6. City’s Exhibit D – Future Land Use Map 

7. City’s Exhibit E – Section 3409 of the International Building Code (Accessibility) 

8. City’s Exhibit F – Section 15-5 City of Gautier’s Code of Ordinances (Noise Ord.) 

 

Page 17 of 88



 

1 
 

CITY OF GAUTIER 
CONDITIONAL USE-MAJOR DEVELOPMENT PERMIT 
GPC CASE NO. 14-20-CU 
 
KENNETH BRIDGETTE AND BERNADETTE GUILLETTE (LIVING WORD TRAINING 
AND RESOURCE CENTER) 
 
REGARDING PARCEL ID NO: 82436050.050 
       
The City of Gautier, at its regular meeting held on November 6, 2014, considered the 
application for a Conditional Use-Major Development Permit for church or place of 
worship as submitted by Kenneth Bridgette and Bernadette Guillette. The parcel subject 
to this Permit is located at 2317 Hwy 90, Gautier, Mississippi, 39553. After due public 
notice, the City Council, having considered the favorable recommendation by the 
Planning Commission, application, testimony and exhibits presented by the applicant, 
the report of the City Staff and all other relevant testimony, exhibits and other evidence, 
pursuant to applicable provisions of the City’s Unified Development Ordinance, hereby 
approves the Conditional Use-Major Development Permit as follows: 
 
1. This proposed Conditional Use-Major is consistent with the goals, objectives and 
policies of the City’s Comprehensive Plan.  
 
2. This proposed Conditional Use-Major is consistent with the character of the 
immediate vicinity of the proposed use.  
 
3. The proposed use, classified as a church or place of worship, is permitted as a 
Conditional Use-Major in the TCMU District.  
 
4. Therefore, the City Council accepts the recommendation of the Planning 
Commission and approves the application submitted on September 5, 2014 for a 
Conditional Use-Major Development Permit.  
 
5. The following additional conditions will ensure that the operation of the proposed 
conditional use will minimize any detrimental effects on neighboring properties and shall 
apply to the project: 
 

a. Within 6 months of issuance of the Major Conditional-Use Permit, the owner 
shall change the existing sign to reflect the new uses of the building as 
approved by the Technical Review Committee. 

 
b. The location shall meet all accessibility requirements for change of occupancy 

as stated in Section 3409 of the International Building Code. (See Exhibit E.) 
 

c. Noise levels shall meet the City’s noise ordinance. (See Exhibit F.) 
 

Page 18 of 88



      

 

d. The location shall meet all parking requirements as set forth in Article VII of 
the Unified Development Ordinance. 

 
6. The City Clerk shall have this permit recorded in the public records of Jackson 
County, at the expense of the applicant, and provide the applicant a copy of the permit 
with the recording information affixed.  
 
7. The Gautier Planning Commission recommended approval of this Conditional 
Use-Major Development Permit on November 6, 2014. 
 
8.      The City Council adopted this Conditional Use-Major Development Permit on a 
recorded vote of _____ ayes to _____ nays to approve the application of Tiffany 
Hudson, located at 2317 Hwy 90, in Gautier, Mississippi, and identified as Jackson 
County Parcel No. 82436050.050.  
 
 
November 18, 2014    _________________________________ 
Date of Issuance    Gordon Gollott, Mayor 
      City of Gautier, Mississippi 
Attest:      3330 Highway 90 
      Gautier, MS  39553 
 
_______________________________  
Cindy Russell 
City Clerk          

Page 19 of 88



Page 20 of 88

egreene
Text Box
  X 



Page 21 of 88



Page 22 of 88



Page 23 of 88



Page 24 of 88



Page 25 of 88



Page 26 of 88



Page 27 of 88

egreene
Text Box
2317Hwy   90

egreene
Line

egreene
Line

egreene
Text Box
Parking Spaces

egreene
Line



Page 28 of 88



Page 29 of 88



HIGHWAY 90

LADNIER RD

OLD SPANISH TRAIL

COLLEGE CIR

SH
AM

RO
CK

 C
T

SERVICE RD

GA
UT

IER
-VA

NC
LE

AV
E 

RD

WEST PARK DR

STINE RD

PAMELA DR

GUILLOTTEVILLE RD

RIDGEWAY DR

STATE ST

TULANE DR

ST
ON

EG
AT

E 
CI

R

CALLE HERMOSA

CAROL DR

GARDEN DALE AVE

NORTHBROOK DR

AUBURN DR

WOOD LANE DR

SH
AM

RO
CK

 C
T

CO
LL

EG
E C

IR

GUILLOTTEVILLE RD

Location Map

Conditional Use

City Of Gautier
Economic Development/Planning

0 800400

Feet

Prepared by the
City of Gautier

Planning  Division

2317 Highway 90



EXHIBIT A

AREA  1

^

Page 30 of 88



Existing Zoning  Map

City Of Gautier
Economic Development/Planning

0 800400

Feet

Legend
AG  Agricultural
PL Public/Semi-Public
PUD  Planned Unit Development
R-1  Low Density Residential
R-2  Multi-Family Residential
R-3  Mobile Home District
MUM
TC
MURC-1
MURC-2
MURC-MW
C-1  Neighborhood Commercial
C-2  Community Commercial
C-3  Highway Commercial
 I-2 Industrial

Prepared by the
City of Gautier

Planning  Division

AREA  1

EXHIBIT B

 ^

Page 31 of 88



LADNIER RD

HIGHWAY 90

OLD SPANISH TRAIL

SH
AM

RO
CK

 C
T

SERVICE RD

PAMELA DR

COLLEGE CIR

WEST PARK DR

ST
ON

EG
AT

E 
CI

R

STINE RD

CAROL DR

GUILLOTTEVILLE RD

NORTHBROOK DR

WOOD LANE DR

CO
LL

EG
E C

IR

SH
AM

RO
CK

 C
T

GUILLOTTEVILLE RD

Existing Land Use Map

City Of Gautier
Economic Development/Planning

0 800400

Feet

Prepared by the
City of Gautier

Planning  Division

Legend
EXISTING LAND USE

Commercial-Retail

Conservation

Civic

Industrial

Marina/Fish Camps

High Density Residential

Mobile Home

Mobile Home Park

Medium Density Residential

Office

Recreation

Very Low to Low Density Residential

Utility

Vacant

AREA 1

EXHIBIT C


^

Page 32 of 88



Future Land Use Map

City Of Gautier
Economic Development/Planning

0 800400

Feet

Prepared by the
City of Gautier

Planning  Division

Legend
Civic

High Impact Commercial

Conservation

High Density Residential

Industrial

Low Density Residential

Medium Density Residential

Mobile Home Residential

Low Impact Commercial

Recreational

Recreational Commercial

Regional Scale Commercial

Mixed Use Residential

Town Center

Very Low Density Residential

AREA 1

EXHIBIT D


^

Page 33 of 88



Page 34 of 88



Page 35 of 88



Page 36 of 88



There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
 

ORDER NUMBER 269-2014 
 

 IT IS HEREBY ORDERED by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, that the advertisement for a Billing and Work Order Software system 
is hereby authorized. 
 
 IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 
execute any and all documents necessary. 
 
 Motion was made by Councilwoman Martin seconded by Councilman Jones 
and the following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES: Gordon Gollott 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 
   Rusty Anderson   
  
 NAYS: None 
 
 ABSENT: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge  
              
       MAYOR 
 
ATTEST: 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
 Passed and adopted by Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, at the meeting of December 2, 2014. 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 37 of 88



1 
 

CITY OF GAUTIER 

MEMORANDUM 

 
 
To:  Samantha Abell, City Manager 

From:    Cindy Russell, City Clerk  

Date:    November 18, 2014 

Subject:            Advertisement for Billing and Work Order Software   

_______________________________________________________________________________ 

 

REQUEST: 

City Council authorization is requested to advertise for a billing software system to ensure the 
management and accuracy of customer accounts on a daily basis for the City of Gautier.          
 

BACKGROUND: 

The City Clerk’s office monitors and provides support services for the billing system which is operated 
by Clearwater Solutions.  At this time, the City has a customer base of approximately ten thousand.  The 
purpose of this RFP is to identify and purchase a software system which would provide a user-friendly 
software program for the preparation, tracking and managing of customer accounts daily.    
 
The objective of this RFP is to identify a web-based billing system with the following capabilities: 
 

   Online Customer Portal:  Customers can view their account details, including water usage and 
billing. 

   E-Billing:  email bills and significantly reduce postage cost.  
   Work Orders: fully-integrated work orders to schedule service orders, get reminders, customer 

automated follow up.   
   Bill for water and sewer along with other utilities such as trash. 
   Multi-Meter Billing:  Track sub-metering usage of singe meters, compound meters, and bill 

accordingly.  Software will recognize a compound meter and store multiple readings for a single 
meter. 

   Detailed Meter Records:  Keep track of all the details of our meters and track the full history of 
meter readings.   

   Meter Changes: Easily manage changing our meters without losing any data.  Combine readings 
from old and new meters into one water bill. 

   Easy Data Exporting:  Flexible methods to export all data: meter data, customers, bills, 
payments, and other system information. 

   Complete Customer Account Management:  reprint or resend bills, assess late fees, see complete 
customer history, mange returned checks, create miscellaneous bills.   

   Reporting: Extensive reporting to view payments, accounts receivable, customers.   
   

RECOMMENDATION: 

Based on the information provided, it is recommended that the Council approve the advertisement for  
billing software for the City of Gautier.   
 
FINANCIAL:   
The cost for this final phase of the automated meter change out program will be funded by the $3,235,000 
Ms. Energy Efficiency Capital Lease Purchase Agreement. 
 

ATTACHMENT(S):  
Advertisement 
Specifications   

Page 38 of 88



Page 39 of 88



Page 40 of 88



Page 41 of 88



Page 42 of 88



Page 43 of 88



Page 44 of 88



Page 45 of 88



There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
 

ORDER NUMBER 270-2014 
 

 IT IS HEREBY ORDERED by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, that the closing of City Administration offices on December 26, 2014, 
in observance of Christmas and non-essential employees to utilize vacation or unpaid 
leave is hereby authorized. 
 
 IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 
execute any and all documents necessary. 
 
 Motion was made by Councilwoman Martin seconded by Councilman Jones 
and the following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES: Gordon Gollot 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 
   Rusty Anderson  
  
 NAYS: None   
 
 ABSENT: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge 
              
       MAYOR 
 
ATTEST: 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
  
 
Passed and adopted by Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of Gautier, 
Mississippi, at the meeting of December 2, 2014. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 46 of 88



There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
 

ORDER NUMBER 271-2014 
 

 IT IS HEREBY ORDERED by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, that the additional repair work needed for the Public Works Back 
Building due to damage from Hurricane Katrina that was not included in the original 
FEMA scope of work (PW#4214) is hereby authorized. 
 
 IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 
execute any and all documents necessary. 
 
 Motion was made by Councilwoman Martin seconded by Councilman Jones 
and the following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES: Gordon Gollott 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 
   Rusty Anderson  
  
 NAYS: None 
 
 ABSENT: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge  
              
       MAYOR 
 
ATTEST: 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
  
Passed and adopted by Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of Gautier, 
Mississippi, at the meeting of December 2, 2014. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Page 47 of 88



1 
 

CITY OF GAUTIER 

MEMORANDUM 

 
 
To:  Samantha Abell, City Manager 
From:   Patty Huffman, Grants & Projects Manager 
Through:   Chandra Nicholson, Economic Development and Planning Director 
Date:    November 17, 2014 
Subject:          Additional Repair Costs for Damage to Public Works Back Building Caused by 

Hurricane Katrina (PW#4214) 
____________________________________________________________________     _____________ 

REQUEST: 

The Economic Development & Planning Department requests authorization for additional repair 
work needed for the Public Works Back Building due to damage from Hurricane Katrina that was not 
included in the original FEMA scope of work.   
 
BACKGROUND: 

The FEMA approved original scope of work for PW #4214 included: 
 Replacement of two metal awnings and three metal roll-up garage doors 
 Repair of the roof along the eastern side of the building 
 Replacement of multiple sections of roofing at warehouse/shop section 
 Replacement of entire roof at the south portion of the building 
 Replacement of a downspout on the west side of the building 
 Repair of a portion of chain link fencing and replacement of a wooden fence 

 

DISCUSSION: 

Once the roof repairs began, the contractor found additional damage to the roof and its supports.  
These additional repairs include:   

    Section B-additional 2,443 sq. ft. of roofing needed   $21,875 
    Section B- eave strut needs to be replaced $850 
    Section C- replace damaged panels $7,800 
    Sections D & E- replace damaged panels $4,800 

Subtotal $35,325 
Minus Contingency -$13,000 

TOTAL $22,325 
 

RECOMMENDATION: 

According to recommendations from the contractor Gibson Maintenance, and the architect, these 
repairs are necessary in order to prevent leaks and the possibility of the roof being blown away in a 
heavy wind.  The Economic Development and Planning Department recommends that it is in the best 
interest of the City to authorize these additional repairs.  At the end of the construction phase, City 
staff will submit change orders to MEMA to be submitted to FEMA during closeout to determine if 
they will allow the additional cost.  The City Finance Department has determined that funds are 
available to cover the additional expense.   
 
The City Council may:  

1. authorize the additional repair costs as presented; or  
2. disapprove some or all of the additional repair costs. 

 

ATTACHMENT(S): 

Change Order  

Page 48 of 88



Document G714TM – 2007 
Construction Change Directive 

AIA Document G714™ – 2007. Copyright © 2001 and 2007 by The American Institute of Architects. All rights reserved. WARNING: This AIA®  Document is 
protected by U.S. Copyright Law and International Treaties. Unauthorized reproduction or distribution of this AIA®  Document, or any portion of it, may 
result in severe civil and criminal penalties, and will be prosecuted to the maximum extent possible under the law. This document was produced by AIA 
software at 15:42:13 on 11/20/2014 under Order No.9823748078_1 which expires on 05/14/2015, and is not for resale. 
User Notes:   (1199060848) 

1 

PROJECT: (Name and address) DIRECTIVE NUMBER: 001 OWNER: 
ARCHITECT: 

CONSULTANT: 
CONTRACTOR: 

FIELD: 
OTHER: 

Gautier Public Works Back Building 
Repairs 

DATE: November 20, 2014 

3309 Gautier Vancleave Road 
Gautier, MS 

CONTRACT FOR: General Construction 

  TO CONTRACTOR: (Name and address) CONTRACT DATED: 9/4/2014 
Gibson Maintenance, LLC 
118 Dennis Lane 
Long Beach, MS 39560 

ARCHITECT’S PROJECT NUMBER: 
0124.14.001 

You are hereby directed to make the following change(s) in this Contract: 
(Describe briefly any proposed changes or list any attached information in the alternative) 

1. Add to remove and replace damaged roof panels on Part C  $7,800.00 
 (this includes removing and replacing screw attachments on all panels) 

2. Add to remove and replace damaged roof panels on Part D, and Part E  $4,800.00 
 (this includes removing and replacing screw attachments on all panels) 

3. Add to remove and replace damaged eave strut beam on Part B (a portion of the overall cost)  $   400.00 

Beginning Allowance         $13,000.00 
Less Construction Change Directive No. One (1)  $13,000.00 
Remaining Allowance         $  0.00 

PROPOSED ADJUSTMENTS 
1. The proposed basis of adjustment to the Contract Sum or Guaranteed Maximum Price is:

• Lump Sum decrease of $0.00

• Unit Price of $  per 

• As provided in Section 7.3.3 of AIA Document A201-2007

• As follows: unchanged

Page 49 of 88

http://www.novapdf.com


AIA Document G714™ – 2007. Copyright © 2001 and 2007 by The American Institute of Architects. All rights reserved. WARNING: This AIA®  Document is 
protected by U.S. Copyright Law and International Treaties. Unauthorized reproduction or distribution of this AIA®  Document, or any portion of it, may 
result in severe civil and criminal penalties, and will be prosecuted to the maximum extent possible under the law. This document was produced by AIA 
software at 15:42:13 on 11/20/2014 under Order No.9823748078_1 which expires on 05/14/2015, and is not for resale. 
User Notes:   (1199060848) 

2 

2. The Contract Time is proposed to (remain unchanged). The proposed adjustment, if any, is 0 days.

When signed by the Owner and Architect and received by the Contractor, this document 
becomes effective IMMEDIATELY as a Construction Change Directive (CCD), and the 
Contractor shall proceed with the change(s) described above. 

Contractor signature indicates agreement 
with the proposed adjustments in Contract 
Sum and Contract Time set forth in this 
CCD. 

  MP Design Group, PLLC Gibson Maintenance, LLC City of Gautier 
ARCHITECT (Firm name) OWNER (Firm name) CONTRACTOR (Firm name) 
1641 Popps Ferry Road Suite A-4 
Biloxi, MS 39532 

118 Dennis Lane  
LongBeach, MS 39560 

3330 Highway 90 
Gautier, MS 39553 

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS 

BY (Signature) BY (Signature) BY (Signature) 

(Typed name) (Typed name) (Typed name) 

DATE DATE DATE 
 

Page 50 of 88

http://www.novapdf.com


GIBSON MAINTENANCE, LLC. 
118 Dennis Lane, P.O. Box 175 

Long Beach, MS 39560 
228-214-3529 office 	228-697-0905 cell 	228-822-0651 fax 

info@qibson - maintenance.com  

The break down for the Gautier Public works back building is as follows: 

Roof B Total roof panel replacement 2443 sq ft $21,875.00 
P&O 	$3,281.00 
Material $1 1,275.00 @$4.62 sq ft 
Labor 	$7,319.00 

Roof B rusted eve strut 
Roof being replaced also cost will be $850.00 
Roof not being replace Cost will be $2,200.00 

Roof C damaged panel and damaged ridge panel replacement. Replace 100% of panel screws 
Reseal tape all panels $7,800.00 
P&O 	$1,170.00 
Material $4,871.00 @ $4.62 sq ft 
Labor 	$1,759.00 

Roof D &E Replace damaged roof panels and ridge cap. Reseal tape all panels and replace 
!00% of panel screws. $4.800.00 
P&O 	$720.00 
Material 	$2,800.00 @$4.62 sq ft 
Labor 	$1,280.00 

We also request an additional 30 days added to the contract as it will take two weeks to order and 
receive materials and two weeks to install. 

***Does  not include rotten wood if found during repairs. 

Mike Steiner 
Gibson Maintenance,LLC 
(228) 217-5295 

Page 51 of 88

jseymour
Highlight

jseymour
Highlight

jseymour
Highlight

jseymour
Text Box
$400 of the eave strut cost is captured in this Construction Change Directive the remaining $450 is captured in Change Order #1



Document G701TM – 2001 
Change Order 

AIA Document G701™ – 2001. Copyright © 1979, 1987, 2000 and 2001 by The American Institute of Architects. All rights reserved. WARNING: This AIA®  
Document is protected by U.S. Copyright Law and International Treaties. Unauthorized reproduction or distribution of this AIA®  Document, or any 
portion of it, may result in severe civil and criminal penalties, and will be prosecuted to the maximum extent possible under the law. This document was 
produced by AIA software at 15:52:02 on 11/20/2014 under Order No.9823748078_1 which expires on 05/14/2015, and is not for resale. 
User Notes:   (1496592465) 

1 

PROJECT (Name and address): CHANGE ORDER NUMBER: 001 OWNER: 
ARCHITECT: 

CONTRACTOR: 
FIELD: 

OTHER: 

Gautier Public Works Back Building 
Repairs 
3309 Gautier Vancleave Road 
Gautier, MS 39553 

DATE: November 20, 2014 

TO CONTRACTOR (Name and address): ARCHITECT’S PROJECT NUMBER: 0124.14.001 
Gibson Maintenance, LLC 
118 Dennis Lane 
Long Beach, MS 39560 

CONTRACT DATE: 9/4/2014 
CONTRACT FOR: General Construction 

THE CONTRACT IS CHANGED AS FOLLOWS: 
(Include, where applicable, any undisputed amount attributable to previously executed Construction Change Directives) 
Remove and replace additional damaged roof panels on Part B. Remove and replace damaged eave strut beam on Part B. 

The original Contract Sum was  $ 124,840.00
The net change by previously authorized Change Orders $ 0.00
The Contract Sum prior to this Change Order was $ 124,840.00
The Contract Sum will be increased by this Change Order in the amount of $ 22,325.00
The new Contract Sum including this Change Order will be $ 147,165.00

The Contract Time will be increased by Thirty (30) days. 
The date of Substantial Completion as of the date of this Change Order therefore is January 17, 2015 

NOTE: This Change Order does not include changes in the Contract Sum, Contract Time or Guaranteed Maximum Price which have 
been authorized by Construction Change Directive until the cost and time have been agreed upon by both the Owner and 
Contractor, in which case a Change Order is executed to supersede the Construction Change Directive.include changes in the 
Contract Sum and Contract Time.  

NOT VALID UNTIL SIGNED BY THE ARCHITECT, CONTRACTOR AND OWNER. 

MP Design Group, PLLC  Gibson Maintenance, LLC City of Gautier 
ARCHITECT (Firm name) CONTRACTOR (Firm name) OWNER (Firm name) 

1641 Popps Ferry Road Suite A-4 
Biloxi, MS 39532 

118 Dennis Lane  
LongBeach, MS 39560 

3330 Highway 90 
Gautier, MS 39553 

ADDRESS ADDRESS ADDRESS 

BY (Signature) BY (Signature) BY (Signature) 

(Typed name) (Typed name) (Typed name) 

DATE DATE DATE 
 

Page 52 of 88

http://www.novapdf.com


GIBSON MAINTENANCE, LLC. 
118 Dennis Lane, P.O. Box 175 

Long Beach, MS 39560 
228-214-3529 office 	228-697-0905 cell 	228-822-0651 fax 

info@qibson - maintenance.com  

The break down for the Gautier Public works back building is as follows: 

Roof B Total roof panel replacement 2443 sq ft $21,875.00 
P&O 	$3,281.00 
Material $1 1,275.00 @$4.62 sq ft 
Labor 	$7,319.00 

Roof B rusted eve strut 
Roof being replaced also cost will be $850.00 
Roof not being replace Cost will be $2,200.00 

Roof C damaged panel and damaged ridge panel replacement. Replace 100% of panel screws 
Reseal tape all panels $7,800.00 
P&O 	$1,170.00 
Material $4,871.00 @ $4.62 sq ft 
Labor 	$1,759.00 

Roof D &E Replace damaged roof panels and ridge cap. Reseal tape all panels and replace 
!00% of panel screws. $4.800.00 
P&O 	$720.00 
Material 	$2,800.00 @$4.62 sq ft 
Labor 	$1,280.00 

We also request an additional 30 days added to the contract as it will take two weeks to order and 
receive materials and two weeks to install. 

***Does  not include rotten wood if found during repairs. 

Mike Steiner 
Gibson Maintenance,LLC 
(228) 217-5295 

Page 53 of 88

jseymour
Highlight

jseymour
Highlight

jseymour
Text Box
$450 of eave strut cost is captured in change order. $400 is captured in Construction Change Directive #1

jseymour
Highlight



 
 
Business Item #5 - TABLED Authorization to enter into a grant agreement with the Mississippi 
Department of Marine Resources (MDMR) for FY 2015 Tidelands funding for the City Park 
Community Center Phase III Project (FY2015-P501-18GA) in the amount of $70,000.00.   
 
Business Item #6 – TABLED Authorization to enter into a grant agreement with the Mississippi 
Department of Marine Resources (MDMR) for FY 2015 Tidelands funding for the Shepard State 
Park Improvements Project (FY2015-P501-16GA) in the amount of $250,000.00.  
  
 

 
There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the 

City of Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
  

ORDER NUMBER 272-2014 
 

 IT IS HEREBY ORDERED by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City 
of Gautier, Mississippi, that the submission of an application to the U.S. Department of 
Homeland Security–Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) for FY 2014 
Assistance to Firefighters Grant (AFG) funding is hereby authorized. 
 
 IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 
execute any and all documents necessary. 
 
 Motion was made by Councilman Vaughan seconded by Councilwoman 
Martin and the following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES: Gordon Gollott 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 
   Rusty Anderson  
  
 NAYS: None 
 
 ABSENT: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge  
              
       MAYOR 
 
ATTEST: 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
Passed and adopted by Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of Gautier, 
Mississippi, at the meeting of December 2, 2014. 

Page 54 of 88



CITY OF GAUTIER 

MEMORANDUM 

 

 
To:  Samantha Abell, City Manager 

From:   Patty Huffman, Grants & Projects Manager 

Through:   Chief Robert Jones, Gautier Fire Department 

Date:    November 19, 2014 

Subject:        FY 2014 Assistance to Firefighters Grant Application Submission 
____________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 

 

REQUEST: 
 

The Gautier Fire Departments requests City Council authorization to submit an application to the 
U.S. Department of Homeland Security- Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) for 
FY 2014 Assistance to Firefighters Grant (AFG) funding.  
 
BACKGROUND: 
 

The purpose of the AFG Program is to enhance the ability of first responders to protect the health 
and safety of the public from fire and related hazards. The three eligible categories for grant 
funding under this program are:  Operations and Safety, Vehicle Acquisition, and Regional 
Programs. 
 
DISCUSSION: 
 

The Gautier Fire Department proposes to apply for funding under the Operations and Safety 
category for thirty-three (33) sets of Personal Protective Equipment (PPEs) and six (6) Self-
Contained Breathing Apparatus (SCBAs). Most of the department’s Personal Protective 
Equipment was purchased with 2004 AFG funding and is now ten years old and considered 
obsolete by FEMA’s standards. Additional SCBAs are needed for the new fire station.  The total 
cost for this grant request is estimated at $115,000.00.  Based on Gautier’s population of fewer 
than 20,000 residents, this grant will require a 5% local match (up to $5,750.00).  Since the period 
of performance is 12 months from date of award, the match amount can be budgeted in next fiscal 
year if necessary.   
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
 

The Fire Department recommends that City Council authorize the submission of an application 
for FY 2014 AFG Grant funding as outlined above prior to the December 5, 2014 deadline. 
 
The City Council may:  

1. approve submission of an application for FY 2014 AFG funding as described above;  
2. approve submission of an application for FY 2014 AFG funding with changes; or 
3. disapprove submission of an application for FY 2014 AFG funding. 

 
ATTACHMENT(S):  
 
 N/A 

Page 55 of 88



There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the 
City of Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
 

ORDER NUMBER 273-2014 
 

 IT IS HEREBY ORDERED by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City 
of Gautier, Mississippi, that the Docket of Claims is hereby approved, provided that all 
entries thereon are true, correct, properly entered and not fraudulent. 
 
 IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 
execute any and all documents necessary. 
 
 Motion was made by Councilwoman Martin seconded by Councilman 
Vaughan and the following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES: Gordon Gollott 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 

Rusty Anderson 
 
 NAYS: None 
 
 ABSENT: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge 
  
              
       MAYOR  
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
 
 Passed and Adopted by Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, at the meeting of December 2, 2014. 
  
 

Page 56 of 88



Page 57 of 88



Page 58 of 88



Page 59 of 88



Page 60 of 88



Page 61 of 88



Page 62 of 88



Page 63 of 88



Page 64 of 88



Page 65 of 88



Page 66 of 88



Page 67 of 88



Page 68 of 88



 
 
 
 

There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City 
of Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
 

ORDER NUMBER 274-2014 
 

 IT IS HEREBY ORDERED by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, that the City Manager is hereby authorized to adjust the 
Comptroller’s salary from Grade 21 Grade 0 to Grade 21 Step 2. 
 
 IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 
execute any and all documents necessary. 
 
 Motion was made by Councilman Vaughan seconded by Councilwoman Martin 
and the following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES: Gordon Gollott 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 
   Rusty Anderson 
 
 NAYS: None 
 
 ABSENT: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge 
  
              
       MAYOR  
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
 
 Passed and Adopted by Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, at the meeting of December 2, 2014. 
  
 
 
 
 

Page 69 of 88



 
 
 
There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
 

ORDER NUMBER 275-2014 

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, that Consent Agenda Items 1-5 are hereby approved. 

 
IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 

execute any and all documents necessary. 
 
 Motion was made by Councilwoman Martin, seconded by Councilman Jones 
and the following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES: Gordon Gollot 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 
   Rusty Anderson 
   
 
 NAYS: None  
 
 Absent: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge 
 
  
              
       MAYOR  
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
 Passed and Adopted by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, at the meeting December 2, 2014. 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 70 of 88



 
 
 
There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
 

ORDER NUMBER 276-2014 

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, that the reappointment of Susan Parol to the Civil Service 
Commission for a period of six (6) years, effective November 2014 thru November 2020 
is hereby approved. 

 
IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 

execute any and all documents necessary. 
 
 Motion was made by Councilwoman Martin, seconded by Councilman Jones  
and the following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES: Gordon Gollot 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 
   Rusty Anderson 
   
 
 NAYS: None  
 
 Absent: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge 
  
              
       MAYOR  
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
 Passed and Adopted by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, at the meeting December 2, 2014. 
 
 
 
 

Page 71 of 88



Page 72 of 88



Page 73 of 88



Page 74 of 88



Page 75 of 88



Page 76 of 88



 
  
 

There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City 
of Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
 

RESOLUTION NUMBER 029-2014 
 

 WHEREAS, the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of Gautier, 
Mississippi received a request to provide in-kind support services to the Gautier Rotary 
Club for the 2014 Gautier Christmas Paraded from the Gautier Police Department and 
the Cultural Services Division.  The event is scheduled for Saturday, December 6, 2014 
from 11:00 A.M. to 2:00 P.M.; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Mayor and Members of the Council have determined that this 
event is an economic development tool to bring favorable notice, opportunities, 
possibilities and resources to the City of Gautier; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Mayor and Members of the Council have determined that the 
donation of in-kind services have been matched by other existing funds; and 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the Mayor and Members of the 
Council of the City of Gautier, Mississippi, as follows to-wit: 
 
 SECTION 1. In-kind services are hereby authorized for the Gautier Police 
Department to provide safety and traffic control. The estimated cost for their in-kind 
contribution will equal approximately $627.75 based on three (3) traffic officers and three 
(3) patrol officers at five (5) hours each. Reserve officers have also been scheduled to 
assist with the event. 
   
 SECTION 2. In-kind services are hereby authorized for the Cultural Services 
Division to provide set-up and use of barricades, bleachers, trash receptacles and clean-
up after the event.  The estimated cost for their in-kind contribution will equal 
approximately $237.00 for the requested labor (2employees @ 8hours each). 
 
 SECTION 3. The total cost of in-kind services is estimated at $864.75. 
 
 SECTION 4. The City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to execute any and all 
documents necessary. 
 
  
 
 
 
 

Page 77 of 88



Motion was made by Councilwoman Martin, seconded by Councilman Jones and the 
following vote was recorded: 
 
 
AYES:  Gordon Gollot 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 
   Rusty Anderson 
   
 
 NAYS: None  
 
 Absent: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge 
  
              
       MAYOR  
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
 Passed and Adopted by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, at the meeting December 2, 2014. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 78 of 88



CITY OF GAUTIER 

MEMORANDUM 

 
 
To:  Samantha Abell, City Manager 
From:   Patty Huffman, Grants & Projects Manager 
Through:   Chandra Nicholson, Director of Economic Development and Planning Dept. 
  Dante Elbin, Chief of Police   
Date:    November 12, 2014  
Subject:          2014 Gautier Rotary Club Christmas Parade In-kind Services Request 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
REQUEST: 

The Gautier Rotary Club requests City Council authorization for in-kind support services to be 
provided by the City for the annual Christmas Parade scheduled for December 6, 2014.  
 
BACKGROUND: 

The Gautier Rotary Club’s 17th Annual Christmas Parade will be held on Saturday, December 6th 
at 11:00 a.m.  The parade route starts at Mississippi Gulf Coast Community College Campus 
(MGCCC) on Hwy 90, goes around Singing River Mall and ends at MGCCC on Gautier-
Vancleave Rd.  Lining-up begins at 9:00 a.m. at the MGCCC east parking lot. The City has 
historically provided logistical support as well as traffic control and security for this event.   
.   
DISCUSSION: 

The Christmas Parade organizers have submitted an in-kind services request for the following: 
 Safety and Traffic Control 
 Set-up and Use of Barricades and Bleachers 
 Trash Receptacles and Clean-up After the Event 

 

The Police Department estimates that their in-kind contribution will equal $627.75 based on 
three (3) traffic officers and three (3) patrol officers at five (5) hours each. Reserve officers have 
also been scheduled to assist with the event. The Cultural Services Division estimates 
approximately $237.00 in in-kind costs for the requested labor (2 employees @ 8 hours each).  
The total cost of in-kind services is therefore estimated at $864.75.  The Mayor and members of 
City Council have determined that the donation of in-kind services has been matched by the 
requesting organization with other existing funds.   
 
RECOMMENDATION: 

The Economic Development and Planning Department recommends that City Council authorize 
the in-kind services requested by the Gautier Rotary Club since the event attracts both locals and 
visitors to the City.  City Council may: 
 1)  approve the in-kind contributions for the 2014 Christmas Parade as requested; 
 2)  approve a different amount of in-kind support; or 
 3)  may decline to authorize in-kind support to the parade this year.   
 

ATTACHMENT(S): 

Gautier Rotary Club In-kind Services Request- 2014 Christmas Parade 
Rotary Christmas Parade Budget Information 

Page 79 of 88



Page 80 of 88



Page 81 of 88



There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City 
of Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
 

ORDER NUMBER 277-2014 
 

  IT IS HEREBY ORDERED by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City 
 of Gautier, Mississippi, that the minutes from Recessed Council Meeting held November 
 18, 2014 are hereby approved. 
 

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 
execute any and all documents necessary. 
Motion was made by Councilwoman Martin, seconded by Councilman Jones  and the 
following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES: Gordon Gollot 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 
   Rusty Anderson 
   
 
 NAYS: None  
 
 Absent: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge 
  
              
       MAYOR  
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
 Passed and Adopted by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, at the meeting December 2, 2014. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 82 of 88



There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, the following: 
 

ORDER NUMBER 278-2014 

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, that the Privilege License Report for October 2014 is hereby 
received. 
   

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 
execute any and all documents necessary. 
 

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 
execute any and all documents necessary. 
 
Motion was made by Councilwoman Martin, seconded by Councilman Jones  and the 
following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES: Gordon Gollot 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 
   Rusty Anderson 
   
 NAYS: None  
 
 Absent: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge 
  
              
       MAYOR  
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
 Passed and Adopted by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, at the meeting December 2, 2014. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 83 of 88



City of Gautier  

Business Registry

Oct-14

Acct. License # Business Name /Owner Amt.

******1171 2015-09-0004269 Logistics on Demand, LLC $22.00

******511 2015-09-0004270 Primo Engineering $22.00

879 2015-10-0004271 Hurd Reality $20.00

1185 2015-10-0004272 Orlando's Inc DBA / Aztecas $60.00

1022 2015-11-0004273 Micheal Martin DBA Martin Plumbing Contractors $20.00

           ******38 2014-10-0004274 Lincoln on Demand Agency $24.20

38 2015-10-0004275 Lincoln on Demand Agency $20.00

32 2015-10-0004276 James Lee Indian Point Rv Resort $30.00

8 2015-10-0004277 Brooks Restaurant Inc Burger King #9337 $30.00

         ******509 2015-09-0004278 Michelle Gautier Lee Landscape Architect $22.00

54 2015-10-0004279 Spa & Tub Manufacturing Co $32.50

59 2015-10-0004280 Palmetto Dental Care $20.00

         ******867 2015-09-0004281 1st Choice Storage $22.00

42 2015-10-0004282 Merchant's and Marine Bank $30.00

941 2015-10-0004283 Victory Chiropratic Center $20.00

876 2015-10-0004284 Redbox Automated Retail $90.00

63 2015-10-0004285 Waffle House Inc $60.00

         ******534 2015-09-0004286 Belk Inc 673 $1,840.00

50 2015-10-0004287 Shanghai Restaurant $35.00

       ******1091 2015-08-0004288 Block Therapy Quilt Shop $22.20

878 2015-10-0004289 Pearson Builders $20.00

1234 2015-10-0004290 Shoe Show $92.50

20 2015-10-0004291 First Federal Savings & Loan $20.00

27 2015-10-0004292 Paradigm Investment/ Hardee's $36.00

62 2015-10-0004293 Town & Country Vet Hospital Inc $30.00

               *1284 2015-10-0004294 Clark's Attic LLC $20.00

1233 2015-10-0004295 New York Pizza $20.00

Page 84 of 88



52 2015-10-0004296 Singing River Grocery $40.00

*1285 2015-10-0004297 Walden Auto Repair $20.00

61 2015-10-0004298 MHC TT Membership, Lp (Equality Lifestyles) $150.00

******778 2015-07-0004299 Collision Depot $22.40

1177 2015-10-0004300 Firestone of Gautier $20.00

* New Business 2

** Slot Amusement 0

*** Due Refund 0

**** Transient Vendor 0

***** Closed Business 0

****** Delinquent Renewals Issued 8

Page 85 of 88



There came for consideration of the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi the following: 

 
ORDER NUMBER 279-2014 

 
 IT IS HEREBY ORDERED by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi that the attached list of Water & Sewer Adjustments is hereby 
approved.  
 
 WHEREAS, the City Council has authorized the City Manager to establish 
payment plans and fee adjustments contingent upon Council approval; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the City Council has adopted a Comprehensive Fee Schedule that  
establishes such fees for the equitable provision of services. 
 
 IT IS FURHTER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 
execute any and all documents necessary. 

 
IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the City Manager or City Clerk is authorized to 

execute any and all documents necessary. 
 
Motion was made by Councilwoman Martin, seconded by Councilman Jones  and the 
following vote was recorded: 
 
 AYES: Gordon Gollot 
   Mary Martin 
   Johnny Jones 
   Casey Vaughan 
   Rusty Anderson 
   
 NAYS: None  
 
 Absent: Hurley Ray Guillotte 
   Adam Colledge 
  
              
       MAYOR  
 
 
ATTEST: 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
 Passed and Adopted by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, at the meeting December 2, 2014. 

Page 86 of 88



ACCT # TOTAL REASON FOR ADJUSTMENT

WATER SEWER LATE CHG GARBAGE TAX  ADJUSTMENT

872508 $88.10 $100.87 $75.00 $263.97 WATER LEAK
940401 $156.18 $165.42 $50.00 $371.60 WATER LEAK
72766 $164.77 $188.65 $25.00 $378.42 WATER LEAK
960423 $67.30 $50.00 $117.30 WATER LEAK
960797 $22.48 $25.74 $48.22 WATER LEAK
872230 $17.06 $19.53 $36.59 WATER LEAK
884689 $206.43 $220.88 $427.31 WATER LEAK
70516 $51.75 $59.25 $111.00 WATER LEAK
51347 $143.99 $164.85 $25.00 $333.84 WATER LEAK
980514 $29.52 $33.80 $63.32 WATER LEAK
940605 $78.75 $90.16 $168.91 WATER LEAK
10937 $78.25 $89.59 $100.00 $267.84 WATER LEAK
70382 $72.03 $82.47 $50.00 $204.50 WATER LEAK
72506 $16.56 $18.96 $50.00 $85.52 WATER LEAK
72525 $103.08 $118.02 $50.00 $271.10 WATER LEAK
20806 $69.56 $79.64 $149.20 WATER LEAK
11262 $140.35 $160.69 $50.00 $351.04 WATER LEAK
883597 $56.71 $64.93 $121.64 WATER LEAK
41329 $67.48 $77.26 $144.74 WATER LEAK
61084 $90.25 $103.33 $193.58 WATER LEAK
72481 $90.66 $103.80 $75.00 $269.46 WATER LEAK
62009 $28.60 $32.75 $61.35 WATER LEAK
9847F $15.73 $18.01 $33.74 WATER LEAK
872110 $89.01 $101.91 $190.92 WATER LEAK
870793 $22.97 $26.30 $49.27 WATER LEAK
60532 $53.36 $61.09 $114.45 WATER LEAK
871209 $110.95 $127.03 $75.00 $312.98 WATER LEAK
50662 $44.33 $50.76 75.00$         $170.09 WATER LEAK
940002 $15.56 $17.82 $33.38 WATER LEAK
950306 $627.95 $661.23 225.00$       $1,514.18 WATER LEAK
870230 $12.42 $14.22 $26.64 WATER LEAK
61419 400.00$       $400.00 LATE FEES

 UTILITY ADJUSTMENTS

THESE FOLLOW POLICY/ RECOMMEND APPROVAL

ADJUSTMENT

Page 87 of 88



_______________________________________________________________________ 
 
Councilwoman Martin made the motion to recess until December 16, 2014 at 6:30 PM. 
Councilman Anderson seconded the motion and the vote carried unanimously with 
Councilman Guillotte and Councilman Colledge being absent. 
 
  
 
 

APPROVED BY: 
 
 
 
 
____________________________ 
MAYOR  

 
 
ATTEST: 
 
       
CITY CLERK 
 
 Submitted for approval by the Mayor and Members of the Council of the City of 
Gautier, Mississippi, at the meeting December 16, 2014. 
 

Page 88 of 88


	CC Packet Combined 11-20-14.pdf
	1 Quasi-Jud Proc
	2 CC Memo
	CITY OF GAUTIER
	MEMORANDUM
	Gautier Planning Commission recommends the City Council approve a Conditional Use-Major Permit to allow a Church at 2317 Highway 90 in a Town Center Mixed Use Zoning District, PID #82436050.050.

	4 Excerpt from GPC Meeting held November 6 (GPC Case 14-20-CU )
	5 GPC Packet 11-6-14

	Billing and Work Order Software Advertisement.pdf
	Council memo - Advertisment for Billing System (3).pdf

	Additional Costs PW Back Bldg and Change Order.pdf
	Council memo regarding Additional Costs PW Back Bldg 
	2014 11 20 CCD #1 124 14 001.pdf
	2014 11 20 Change Order #1 124 14 001

	2014 Christmas Parade Inkind Services Request Form.pdf
	Council memo regarding Christmas Parade Inkind Svc-2014.pdf
	2014 Christmas Parade Inkind Services Request Form
	CCF




