Tricia Thigpen

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Cindy Russell <crussell@gautier-ms.gov>
Friday, May 17, 2013 9:11 AM

Tricia Thigpen

FW: Joey Cumbest

From: Samantha Abell [mailto:sabell@gautier-ms.gov]
Sent: Friday, May 17, 2013 6:30 AM

To: Tricia Thigpen; Cindy Russell

Cc: chad.jordan@clearwatersol.com

Subject: Fwd: Joey Cumbest

Please add to next consent agenda. It didn't make it this time.

Thanks.

Samantha Abell
Gautier City Manager

Begin forwarded message:

From: Chad Jordan <chad.jordan@clearwatersol.com>
Date: May 15, 2013 3:34:30 PM CDT

To: "Samantha D. Abell" <sabell@gautier-ms.gov>
Ce: dbrown(@gautier-ms.gov

Subject: Fwd: Joey Cumbest

Do we need to hear from the rest of the council or can we go ahead and credit his account?

Begin forwarded message:

From: Tommy Fortenberry <tlfortenberry@hotmail.com>

Date: May 8, 2013 4:06:31 PM CDT

To: john <jfjones]@cableone.net>

Ce: "adamcolledge@aol.com" <adamcolledge(@aol.com>, Samantha Abell
<sabell@gautier-ms.gov>, Gordon Gollott <gollottd@bellsouth.net>, Hurley Ray
Guillotte <councilmanward2@gautier-ms.gov>, Mary Martin
<marymartincouncilwomanatlarge@yahoo.com>, Scott Macfarland
<sdmacfarland@peoplepc.com>, Chad Jordan <chad.jordan@clearwatersol.com>
Subject: Re: Joey Cumbest

Mr. Cumbest is a good man. He is well capable of paying his bills. But I don't
blame him for not wanting topay something that he's not getting.

Mayor Fortenberry



On May 8, 2013, at 2:45 PM, "john" <jfjones] @cableone.net> wrote:

No problem for me.

From: adamcolledge@aol.com
Sent: Wednesday, May 08, 2013 2:37 PM
To: Samantha Abell ; 'Gordon Gollott' ; 'Hurley Ray Guillotte' ; 'Johnn

Jones' ; 'Mary Martin' ; 'Mayor Fortenberry' ; 'Scott Macfarland'
Cc: Chad Jordan

Subject: Re: Joey Cumbest

Works for me.
Sent from my Cellular South BlackBerry® Smartphone

From: "Samantha Abell" <sabell@gautier-ms.gov>
Date: Wed, 8 May 2013 14:33:38 -0500

To: 'Adam Colledge'<adamcolledge@aol.com>; 'Gordon
Gollott'<gollottd @bellsouth.net>; 'Hurley Ray
Guillotte'<councilmanward2 @gautier-ms.gov>; 'Johnny
Jones'<JFJonesl@cableone.net>; 'Mary
Martin'<marymartincouncilwomanatlarge@yahoo.com>; 'Mayor
Fortenberry'<tifortenberry@hotmail.com>; 'Scott
Macfarland'<sdmacfarland @peoplepc.com>

ReplyTo: <sabell@gautier-ms.gov>

Cc: <chad.jordan@clearwatersol.com>

Subject: FW: Joey Cumbest

Council,

We have a property owner who has been paying his water/sewer bill
although 3 of his immediate neighbors have not received bills and have
not been paying. In order to address this, the residents are now
receiving bills that include the water/sewer that they’ve used in the past
without charge. However, this still leaves the fact that Mr. Cumbest has
some outstanding fees from when he stopped paying after realizing his
neighbors weren’t being charged. To accept our role in the confusion
that led to Mr. Cumbest ceasing payments, | recommend that we credit
Mr. Cumbest’s account for $671.55. This matter will be placed on your
next consent agenda as a simple “account credit”. Please see the email
below.

Thank you.

From: Chad Jordan [mailto:chad.jordan@clearwatersol.com]
Sent: Tuesday, May 07, 2013 1:20 PM

To: Samantha D. Abell

Cc: dbrown@gautier-ms.gov

Subject: Fwd: Joey Cumbest




I would like to credit his account the amount listed below for the
purpose of closure and the fact that he was diligent and honest in
paying for many years. Let me know your thoughts.

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Darlene Brown" <dbrown(@gautier-

ms.gov>

Date: May 7, 2013 12:10:08 PM CDT
To: "'Chad Jordan"
<chad.jordan@clearwatersol.com>
Subject: Joey Cumbest

Reply-To: <dbrown@gautier-ms.gov>

Chad,

The balance for Joey Cumbest is
$671.55. The total on his water not paid
is $289.50. The total on his sewer is
$331.05. Let me know if you need
anything else on this account.

Darlene Brown, Customer Service Manager
ClearWater Solutions, LLC

3330 Hwy 90

Gautier, MS 39553

228-497-2276



